
                                    
 

Waiver and Release 
 

 
By registering to participate in “CE in the Vineyards” (the “Event”), offered by the Charlotte 
Regional Realtor® Association, Inc. (the “Association”), and in consideration for being allowed 
to participate in the Event, the receipt and sufficiency of which is hereby acknowledged, I 
agree to be bound by each of the following provisions of this waiver and release (the 
“Waiver”) with the knowledge that the Association will rely on same: 
 
Voluntary Participation. I understand and confirm that my participation in the Event is 
voluntary. I am in good health and suffer from no physical or mental condition that would 
make me especially susceptible to injury or disability while participating in the Event. 
 
Transportation.  I understand and agree that as a participant in this Event, I am required to 
use the transportation provided by the Association both to and from the Event.  I am not 
permitted to drive my own vehicle to and/or from the Event and will not be permitted to arrive 
to or leave from the Event as a passenger in any other vehicle. 
 
Assumption of Risk. I assume all risks in any way connected with my participation in the 
Event.  I accept personal responsibility for any liability, injury, loss, or damage in any way 
connected with my participation in the Event. 
 
Alcohol Consumption. I understand that I am not permitted to consume alcoholic beverages 
at any time during the continuing education portion of the Event.  I agree that should I fail to 
abide by this provision, the Association has the right to excuse me from further participation 
in the Event and that I will not receive continuing education credit.  
I further understand that following the continuing education portion of the Event, I am free to 
participate in wine tasting provided that prior to doing so I produce government-issued photo 
identification showing that I am at least twenty-one (21) years of age. I understand that all 
alcohol consumption is at my own discretion, risk and liability and I agree to hold the 
Association, its employees, agents, officers, directors and affiliated entities harmless.   
 
Waiver and Release.  I hereby release and forever discharge and hold harmless the 
Association, its employees, agents, officers, directors and affiliated entities from and against 
any and all liability, claims, and demands of any kind or nature which may arise from my 
participation in the Event.   
 
Photographic Release.  I hereby grant to the Association all right, title and interest in any and 
all photographic images (the “Images”) that may be made during the Event.  The Association 
has the right to publish, by any method and in any media, the Images into its website, 
publications, brochures, social media sites or informational, educational, advertising, or 
promotional materials relating thereto (collectively, the “Works”). I agree the Association is 
and shall be the exclusive owner of all right, title, and interest, including copyright, in the 
Images and the Works. 
 
 
 



I HAVE READ THIS ENTIRE DOCUMENT AND AM INDICATING MY VOLUNTARY 
AGREEMENT TO THE PROVISIONS OF THIS WAIVER. 
 
____________________________________________  ________________ 
Signature         Date 
 
____________________________________________  ________________ 
Name, print         Member No. 


